fearae e faum= aw aRare

faie 09 Rya=R, 2020

e fowo—faem—fags / 1— 10/2020—1%141%[ oy faum a9 &1 ufhar vd el
AT Haelt, 1973 & FRIM 140 @ or=id RieNfe fdare (Remeral uqer weied) faeres,
2020 (2020 T eI H=® 5) ST Sl f&Ald 09 AR, 2020 &1 A oo fau a1 4
RMT BT FHT 8, FIAEIRY BT Gard o9 3§ Jiad d= &g i fFar o g |

FXARIRT / —
afea,
20 o faem @]

2020 T faggs A= 5

enfre faare (RAme ucer demer) faes, 2020

Ul BT PH
Wug :
1. Gfereg A\ IR IR |
2. YT 22 BT I |
3. YT 259 BT HINEH |
4. RT 25€ T TN |
5. 2020 EF\) [HTd T U ASYT3I TTh 4 Bl I"N‘H"I 3ﬁ? g ?\‘IJIII

2020 &1 faeRrs A&gid 5
e fdarg (Reraer uawr Heme) faerre, 2020
(e w1 % Reenfua w9 )

[RATIE UQE IS T JAT AN i dare Afaferad, 1947 (1947 &7 A9 A=
14) ®T FIEH A & v fad® |

YR RS & ShecRd 9y d fRoma u<wr fagm ayr grr f=foRag wu 8§ I8
s e —

1. dfed 99 iR UR™—(1) 39 SmAfm @1 wdfera AW sfenfie fdarg (ReEmad
oY A TR, 2020 |

(2) IE 9 Falg, 2020 I UG B3 HAHASIT ST |



2. ©RT 22 $T JEA.——2A9d U< I BT JoIT AN, 3ienifires faare sifef=m, 1047
(1947 &1 14) (T 399 S UTAq "o MR HET AT 8) B ORI 22 B SUART (1) AR
(2) 9, “dlIp SUIRT [T A&l & YA ‘MR IR—alld SYART HaT” Ieg - wMfd fby o |

3. HRT 259 HI HRIEA—d AW & aRT 259 & @Ue (@) ¥, “Ugg " o<l &
WM W 916 e eq I SIe |

4. ORI 25€ P UM —d ARAFTTH 3 gRT 25€¢ @ ITWIRT (1) 4, T A A&l B
I UR ST A 96 X ST |

5. 2020 @ foAMIA UQ¥ SATQY €IS 4 & fFRET R agfaa——(1) aiefie
faare (fRATarel UQer AeMe) SATSTT, 2020 & YaggRT R+ fdhar Smar 2|

(2) U FRET @ 8 gU 1 39 UBR FRANT oeaesl & ol & 18 ®Is a1
HNATS 39 ARFE & TR Sudel & T faftm= wu # @ 78 Awsh S |

Sl 3R BRN BT HI

3N ISRIBROT & T 4, el fdare S, 1947 (1947 T 14), S U D=
fere 8 @ @ Iudy smEferd B MU ¥ Fifs 3 Suddl o fed @E avf & doifa =@
far g1 g8y mar § P Sienfe faare «ifdfm, 1047 @ smEfod Sudy s H
grsde e @1 P &1 § 986 § AR T8 H IRAR B I AT B 91 91fd
T 2| RHrEd U g H e e, Sared ok ISR & bRl H ghg dRe a
PRAR PR D GIHaT H AR i HRT o1 5™ QA & gao+ d yReRar gARad a-+ gq
gate AR § Ho HeEE By S 3awde 8 Y © | 4R WRGR gRI IR™ by 1Y A
S SfUST” HRIPH & JTAR QU H "PHRAR BRI bl GUHAT W Afardaei H d D g |
gAfeTy, ST WUAl & AII—ARS BHDRI Bl Udh ABRID AR BRAR el dIdrarvl GaT
I B foy, Sl faare fafH, 1947 (1947 &1 14) & HB IUTEl B FUMT HAT
3TEIH Bl AT & |

fEarae U faus |91 @9 H 981 ol iR f3Hed uswr S9 dl JuT AN SiEfe
faare e, 1047 # WER ST AFERS B AT o7 | SAMY fZHEA USw & AU g,
YRA & IFUT B AL DI AU BT & UL, IR & FAUH & IJe0e 213 & TvS
(1) & a9 yaw wfdadl &1 GANT dRd 8, 3AEnflie fdaq (BHerd uqer |elee) searqyl,
2020 (2020 T LAY WHIH 4) ANR 7 Jls, 2020 DI WA fHam 1 o 59 Io19x
(3—Toe), fRArae Uee ¥ AN 9 S[elTs, 2020 Pl YHIRIG AT AT o7 | 376, Iaa AR DI
o fodl SurvaRwr & afie faer g uforenfaa farar < <er 2

I fadae Sudad SgewEl @ uff & fow 2

(faspa Rig)
TR 7 |



AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

Bill No. 5 of 2020

THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES (HHIMACHAL PRADESH AMENDMENT)
BILL, 2020

ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES

Clauses:

1. Short title and commencement.

2. Amendment of section 22.

3. Amendment of section 25F.

4. Amendment of section 25K.

5. Repeal of the Himachal Pradesh Ordinance No. 4 of 2020 and savings.

Bill No. 5 of 2020

THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES (HHMACHAL PRADESH AMENDMENT)
BILL, 2020

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)
A
BILL

to amend the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (Act No. 14 of 1947) in its application to the
Sate of Himachal Pradesh.

BE it enacted by the Legidative Assembly of Himacha Pradesh in the Seventy-first Y ear of
the Republic of India asfollows :—

1. Short title and commencement.—(1) This Act may be called the Industrial Disputes
(Himachal Pradesh Amendment) Act, 2020.

(2) It shal be deemed to have come into force on 9th day of July, 2020.

2. Amendment of section 22.—In section 22 of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of
1947) in its application to the State of Himachal Pradesh (hereinafter referred to as the “principal
Act”), in sub-sections (1) and (2), after the words “public utility service”, the words “and non-
public utility service” shall be inserted.

3. Amendment of section 25F.—In section 25F of the principal Act, in clause (b), for
the words “fifteen days’, the words “sixty days’ shall be substituted.

4.  Amendment of section 25K.— In section 25K of the principal Act, in sub-section (1),
for the words “ one hundred”, the words “two hundred” shall be substituted.



5. Repeal of the Himachal Pradesh Ordinance No. 4 of 2020 and savings—(1) The
Industrial Disputes (Himachal Pradesh Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 is hereby repeal ed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken under the Ordinance so
repealed, shall be deemed to have been validly done or taken under the corresponding provisions of
thisAct.

STATEMENT OF OBJECTSAND REASONS

In the era of economic liberalisation, some of the provisions of the Industrial Disputes Act,
1947 (Act No. 14 of 1947) which is a Central legislation, have become outdated because these
provisions have not been amended for the last so many years. It has been found that the outdated
provisions of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 are impediment in attracting the private investment
and are also hampering the ease of doing business in the State. In order to increase industrial
investment, production and employment opportunities and further enhancement of ease of doing
business in the State of Himachal Pradesh and to ensure transparency in enforcement of the Labour
Laws, some amendments are necessary in the aforesaid Act. As per “Make in India’ programme
launched by the Government of India, one of the requirements is “Ease of doing business’ in the
Country. Therefore, to provide a conducive and business friendly environment to the Industrial
establishments as well as to the workmen, there is an urgent need to amend some provisions of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947.

Since, the Himachal Pradesh Legidative Assembly was not in session and the amendments
in the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 in its application to the State of Himacha Pradesh had to be
made urgently, therefore, the Governor of Himachal Pradesh, after obtaining the instructions from
the President of India, in exercise of the powers conferred under clause (1) of article 213 of the
Congtitution of India, promulgated the Industria Disputes (Himacha Pradesh Amendment)
Ordinance, 2020 (Ordinance No. 4 of 2020) on 7th July, 2020 which was published in the Rgjpatra
(e-Gazette), Himacha Pradesh on 9th July, 2020. Now, the said Ordinance is being replaced by a
regular Legisation without any modification.

This Bill seeksto achieve the aforesaid objectives.
(BIKRAM SINGH)

Minister-in-Charge.
SHIMLA :



